



County Auditors' Association of Ohio

66 East Lynn Street • Columbus, Ohio 43215 • (614) 228-2226 • Fax: (614) 228-8901 • www.caaao.org

FRANK J. GLIHA
Geauga County
President

March 11, 2015

RHONDA EDDY-STIENECKER
Allen County
Vice President

Robert Hinkle, Chief Deputy Auditor
Ohio Auditor of State
88 E. Broad Street, 5th Floor
Columbus, Ohio 43215

MICHAEL E. YODER
Logan County
Second Vice President

JON SLATER, JR.
Fairfield County
Third Vice President

Dear Bob:

WILLIAM D. McFARLAND
Washington County
Secretary/Treasurer

In accordance with Section 319.04(A) of the Ohio Revised Code, attached please find the Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report as of March 9, 2015. County Auditors are required to complete 16 credit hours during the first year of their term of office and a total of 24 hours over the entire term. This report encompasses the entire term of office March 14, 2011 to March 9, 2015.

FRANCES S. LESSER, Esq.
Executive Director

The County Auditors' Association of Ohio (CAAO) is proud of the accomplishments of County Auditors in continuing education. We are pleased to provide you with this report. Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions regarding the CAAO Continuing Education program.

BETTY S. DEVER
Assistant Director

THOMAS P. PAPPAS, Esq.
Legislative Counsel

Sincerely yours,

Frances S. Lesser
Executive Director

Enclosure

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
Adams	David Gifford				
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		174	7/20/2012	Local Government Forum: Municipalities, Twnh	2
		18	5/20/2011	State Budget Update	1
		191	9/24/2012	School Funding Present and Future	1
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		244	3/7/2013	Financial Statements	8
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		259	5/17/2013	CAAO Mission, Policy., Collaboration with CA	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropriat	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		305	9/20/2013	Housing Trends & Choices in SW Ohio	1
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		353	1/17/2014	Butler County Web Portal	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		373	5/16/2014	ADAMH Boards and Local Government in Ohio	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		391	7/18/2014	Mt. Orab Police Department Canine Unit	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		43	7/22/2011	Montgomery County Reappraisal	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		438	1/16/2015	BOR Reform Discussion	1
		50	9/16/2011	CAUV Qualification	1
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				<i>Adams Total</i>	145.75
Allen	Rhonda Eddy				
		131	3/23/2012	School District Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		132	3/23/2012	GIS in Erie County	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		155	5/25/2012	Legislative issues	2
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		185	8/24/2012	The Appraisal and After the BOR is Filed	1.25
		19	5/20/2011	Board of Tax Appeals	1
		192	9/27/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1
		202	10/26/2012	Lucas County Land Bank	1.5
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		245	3/22/2013	Recent Developments in Board of Revision Proc	1.25
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		251	4/26/2013	State Biennial Budget & Legislative Update	1.25
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		261	5/24/2013	State Budget Update	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropriat	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		292	7/19/2013	Discussion of Biennial Budget	1
		299	8/23/2013	Fraud Prevention: A Proactive Approach	1
		3	3/25/2011	ODA Weights & Measures Training Program	0.75
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		308	9/27/2013	Social Media & Technology in Workplace	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		314	10/25/2013	Legal Updates & Sen. Randy Gardner	1.75
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		369	4/25/2014	How BTA is Affecting BOR & Cases	1.75
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		393	7/25/2014	Qualities of Leadership	1
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		410	10/24/2014	Forestry Issues	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		9	4/29/2011	Budget Updates State Rep. Goodwin	1.75
				<i>Allen Total</i>	139.5
Ashland	Cindy Funk				
		240	3/8/2013	Update on State Bienial Budget w/ Rep. Amstutz	1
		247	4/12/2013	Updates from BTA and Dept of Taxation	1.75
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		309	10/4/2013	A.L.I.C.E. Training	1.25
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		349	6/13/2013	Ohio Public Records & Open Mtg Laws	3
		363	4/4/2014	Update from Tax Commissioner	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		401	9/12/2014	Preparing for Life's Curves	1.5
		407	10/3/2014	131st General Assembly Priorities	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		435	12/19/2014	* Overview of Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		440	1/30/2015	GIS in CAUV Field Verification	1
				<i>Ashland Total</i>	72.5
Ashtabula	Roger Corlett				
		11	5/6/2011	Report from Office of Auditor of State	0.75
		113	3/2/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		114	3/2/2012	Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		147	5/4/2012	Impact of HB 14 - Dangerous Dogs	1
		148	5/4/2012	Ohio's Housing Markets, Why Data Matters	0.5
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		189	9/14/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities and Update	1
		202	10/26/2012	Lucas County Land Bank	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		234	2/8/2013	Biennial State Budget - OBM Perspective	1.25
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropriat	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		288	7/12/2013	Perspectives on Ohio's New Budget	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		303	9/13/2013	Changes in Dog Licensing Laws	1
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		355	1/31/2014	View from the Statehouse/ Leg Update	1
		356	3/7/2014	Programs Provided at MCCTC	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		363	4/4/2014	Update from Tax Commissioner	1.5
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		401	9/12/2014	Preparing for Life's Curves	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		440	1/30/2015	GIS in CAUV Field Verification	1
		62	10/14/2011	Taxation of Oil and Gas Reserves	1.5
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				<i>Ashtabula Total</i>	145.5
Athens	Jill A. Thompson				
		101	1/19/2012	Oil and Gas Development	1.5
		127	3/10/2012	Macroeconomics & Business Fluctuations	35
		128	3/10/2012	Financial Statement Analysis	35
		13	5/13/2011	Update on Ohio Weights & Measures Program	0.25
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		15	5/13/2011	Sticker Shock of CAUV Values Appraisal Ctys	1
		158	5/26/2012	Financial Statement Analysis	35
		159	5/26/2012	Quantitative Analysis of Financial Mkts	35
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		180	8/2/2012	SE Ohio Clean Energy Business Roundtable	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		181	9/23/2011	Ohio Public Records and Sunshine Law	3
		182	8/11/2012	Alternative Investments/Capital Investments	35
		183	8/11/2012	Managerial Economics	35
		190	9/14/2012	Ohio GFOA Conference	10
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		229	11/3/2012	Financial Management I	35
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		230	11/3/2012	Int'l Trade and Financial Economics	35
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		248	4/12/2013	Recent Developments in BOR Process	1
		249	4/12/2013	Solutions to Collecting Delinquent Prop Tax	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		286	5/10/2013	Financial Mngt II, Financial Derivatives	70
		287	6/17/2013	CORSA 101 - Risk Management	2.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		291	7/11/2013	* Can I Do That? Overview of Ohio Ethics	1
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		304	9/13/2013	Ohio GFOA 2013 Conference	13

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		311	10/11/2013	ODNR Forestry Property Tax Laws	1.5
		317	9/19/2013	Building Effective Teams	1
		318	9/26/2013	Wellness for the Boss	4.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		334	12/6/2013	Mass Appraisal Class	30
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		348	11/7/2013	Targeting Fraud: Safeguarding Integrity	10.5
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		352	1/10/2014	Update from Local Legislators	0.5
		357	2/19/2014	Agriculture Day at the Capital	5
		358	2/20/2014	Marketing on a Dime	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		376	5/6/2014	Emerging Trends in Fraud 2014	12.5
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		392	7/23/2014	GASB 68 Forum	1.5
		402	8/7/2014	LeanOhio Boot Camp	39
		403	9/17/2014	GFOA Conference	13.5
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		437	1/9/2015	District Priorities for 2015	1
		444	2/13/2015	BOR Rules and Procedures	2
		51	9/15/2011	Dept. of Development Incentive Programs	1.5
		55	9/22/2011	2011 GFOA Annual Conference	14
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	4
		72	11/17/2011	Effectively Navigating Your Business Yaxes	1.5
		85	12/8/2011	How State of Ohio Programs can help your Busi	1.5
				<i>Athens Total</i>	587.75
Auglaize	Janet Schuler				
		102	1/20/2012	Weights & Measures Issues	1
		129	3/16/2012	2012 Ohio Farm Bureau Agenda	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		153	5/18/2012	Atty Gen Local Government Debt Collection Pr	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		174	7/20/2012	Local Government Forum: Municipalities, Twnh	2
		18	5/20/2011	State Budget Update	1
		191	9/24/2012	School Funding Present and Future	1
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		241	3/15/2013	What Can Financial Forecasting do for Local Go	1
		245	3/22/2013	Recent Developments in Board of Revision Proc	1.25
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		259	5/17/2013	CAAO Mission, Policy., Collaboration with CA	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		292	7/19/2013	Discussion of Biennial Budget	1
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		353	1/17/2014	Butler County Web Portal	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		373	5/16/2014	ADAMH Boards and Local Government in Ohio	1
		391	7/18/2014	Mt. Orab Police Department Canine Unit	1
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		409	10/17/2014	* Cole's Warriors - No Second Chances	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		50	9/16/2011	CAUV Qualification	1
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				<i>Auglaize Total</i>	126.5
Belmont	Andrew L. Sutak				
		105	2/10/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		106	2/10/2012	School Districts & Converting Inside Milage	0.75
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		47	8/19/2011	Key provisions of Budget Bill, Shale Oil & GasT	1.75
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	3
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Belmont Total	88.5
Brown	Jill Hall				
		232	1/18/2013	Expedited Foreclosure	1
		241	3/15/2013	What Can Financial Forecasting do for Local Go	1
		244	3/7/2013	Financial Statements	8
		246	4/9/2013	Certified Public Records Training	3
		300	8/22/2013	* Vivitrol: An Opioid Receptor Antagonist	2
		301	9/5/2013	* Ohio Ethics Law: What Should I Know	1
		305	9/20/2013	Housing Trends & Choices in SW Ohio	1
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		391	7/18/2014	Mt. Orab Police Department Canine Unit	1
				<i>Brown Total</i>	<u>47.5</u>
Butler	Roger Reynolds				
		102	1/20/2012	Weights & Measures Issues	1
		129	3/16/2012	2012 Ohio Farm Bureau Agenda	1
		153	5/18/2012	Atty Gen Local Government Debt Collection Pr	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		191	9/24/2012	School Funding Present and Future	1
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		232	1/18/2013	Expedited Foreclosure	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		330	8/21/2013	Accounting & Auditing Update	1
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		353	1/17/2014	Butler County Web Portal	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		438	1/16/2015	BOR Reform Discussion	1
		445	2/23/2015	* Supervisor's Guide to Substance Abuse	1
		5	3/7/2011	Local Gov't Officials Conference	4
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
				Butler Total	84
Carroll	E. Leroy VanHorne				
		11	5/6/2011	Report from Office of Auditor of State	0.75
		172	7/6/2012	Fracking and Your Drinking Water	1.5
		189	9/14/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities and Update	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		234	2/8/2013	Biennial State Budget - OBM Perspective	1.25
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyover	0.5
		240	3/8/2013	Update on State Biennial Budget w/ Rep. Amstutz	1
		247	4/12/2013	Updates from BTA and Dept of Taxation	1.75
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		258	4/18/2013	Disciplining a Difficult Employee	2

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		288	7/12/2013	Perspectives on Ohio's New Budget	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		303	9/13/2013	Changes in Dog Licensing Laws	1
		309	10/4/2013	A.L.I.C.E. Training	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		355	1/31/2014	View from the Statehouse/ Leg Update	1
		356	3/7/2014	Programs Provided at MCCTC	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		363	4/4/2014	Update from Tax Commissioner	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		407	10/3/2014	131st General Assembly Priorities	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		440	1/30/2015	GIS in CAUV Field Verification	1
		45	8/5/2011	Paperless Reappraisal, Timing of Reapp, OSIP Fl	1.5
		62	10/14/2011	Taxation of Oil and Gas Reserves	1.5
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Carroll Total	103.75
Champaign	Karen Bailey				
		115	3/1/2012	Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal	30
		129	3/16/2012	2012 Ohio Farm Bureau Agenda	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		153	5/18/2012	Atty Gen Local Government Debt Collection Pr	1
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		174	7/20/2012	Local Government Forum: Municipalities, Twnh	2
		191	9/24/2012	School Funding Present and Future	1
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		232	1/18/2013	Expedited Foreclosure	1
		238	2/22/2013	Tax Policy and Rights to Appeal	7
		241	3/15/2013	What Can Financial Forecasting do for Local Go	1
		243	3/21/2013	* Standards of Professional Practice & Ethics	7
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		292	7/19/2013	Discussion of Biennial Budget	1
		305	9/20/2013	Housing Trends & Choices in SW Ohio	1
		373	5/16/2014	ADAMH Boards and Local Government in Ohio	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		409	10/17/2014	* Cole's Warriors - No Second Chances	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		43	7/22/2011	Montgomery County Reappraisal	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		438	1/16/2015	BOR Reform Discussion	1
		49	9/2/2011	Assessment Administration	30
		50	9/16/2011	CAUV Qualification	1
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		68	10/28/2011	Taxation of Wind Turbines	1
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
Champaign Total					131

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
Clark	John Federer				
		129	3/16/2012	2012 Ohio Farm Bureau Agenda	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		174	7/20/2012	Local Government Forum: Municipalities, Twnh	2
		191	9/24/2012	School Funding Present and Future	1
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		232	1/18/2013	Expedited Foreclosure	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		241	3/15/2013	What Can Financial Forecasting do for Local Go	1
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropriat	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		305	9/20/2013	Housing Trends & Choices in SW Ohio	1
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		373	5/16/2014	ADAMH Boards and Local Government in Ohio	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		4	4/5/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		409	10/17/2014	* Cole's Warriors - No Second Chances	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		43	7/22/2011	Montgomery County Reappraisal	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		5	3/7/2011	Local Gov't Officials Conference	4
		50	9/16/2011	CAUV Qualification	1
		6	4/7/2011	Ohio Ethics - Can I Do That?	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
				Clark Total	147
Clermont	Linda L. Fraley				
		100	5/19/2011	Ohio Business Tax Updates	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		273	4/11/2012	Advanced Budget Processing	1
		274	5/10/2012	Professional Issues Update	4
		275	5/17/2012	Dayton Accounting Show	16
		276	7/2/2012	CPA Voice Oct-Dec 2011	3
		277	7/2/2012	CPA Voice Jan-May 2012	5
		278	7/3/2012	CPA Voice June 2012	1
		279	7/27/2012	CPA Voice Aug 2011 & July 2012	2
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		280	7/30/2012	CPA Voice Sept 2011	1
		281	12/4/2012	CPA Voice - Aug-Oct 2012	3
		282	4/30/2013	Purchasing, Benefits, Budget Process	3
		283	4/30/2013	Cashiering for Munis, Managing Assets	2
		284	5/1/2013	Administering Tailored Dashboard	1
		285	3/19/2013	VCPA Voice Jan & Feb 2013	2
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		391	7/18/2014	Mt. Orab Police Department Canine Unit	1
		438	1/16/2015	BOR Reform Discussion	1
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		87	4/27/2011	Munis 101	3
		88	4/27/2011	Using Gneral Billing	1
		89	4/28/2011	Applicant Tracking and MSS	2
		90	4/28/2011	Basic Budgeting	1
		91	4/28/2011	Advanced Budget Processing	1
		92	5/18/2011	International Investment Opportunity	1.5
		93	5/18/2011	Individual Tax Update	1.5
		94	5/18/2011	Bridging the 1040 Gap - Preparr to Reviewer	1.5
		95	5/18/2011	Corporate Tax Update	1.5
		96	5/18/2011	Form 990 Significant Changes	1.5
		97	5/19/2011	* Ohio Ethics Rules & Applications	3
		98	5/19/2011	New Rules for Federal Tax Preparers	1.5
		99	5/19/2011	Ohio Income Tax Updates	2
				<i>Clermont Total</i>	103
Clinton	Terry Habermehl				
		1	3/16/2011	* Ohio Ethics Seminar	1
		102	1/20/2012	Weights & Measures Issues	1
		129	3/16/2012	2012 Ohio Farm Bureau Agenda	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		153	5/18/2012	Atty Gen Local Government Debt Collection Pr	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		18	5/20/2011	State Budget Update	1
		191	9/24/2012	School Funding Present and Future	1
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		373	5/16/2014	ADAMH Boards and Local Government in Ohio	1
		378	9/22/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		391	7/18/2014	Mt. Orab Police Department Canine Unit	1
		409	10/17/2014	* Cole's Warriors - No Second Chances	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		43	7/22/2011	Montgomery County Reappraisal	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		50	9/16/2011	CAUV Qualification	1
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
				<i>Clinton Total</i>	117.5
Columbiana	Nancy Milliken				
		11	5/6/2011	Report from Office of Auditor of State	0.75
		113	3/2/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		114	3/2/2012	Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		134	4/3/2012	General Ledger Software	30
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		189	9/14/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities and Update	1
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		234	2/8/2013	Biennial State Budget - OBM Perspective	1.25
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		247	4/12/2013	Updates from BTA and Dept of Taxation	1.75
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		303	9/13/2013	Changes in Dog Licensing Laws	1
		309	10/4/2013	A.L.I.C.E. Training	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		356	3/7/2014	Programs Provided at MCCTC	1
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		440	1/30/2015	GIS in CAUV Field Verification	1
		62	10/14/2011	Taxation of Oil and Gas Reserves	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
<i>Columbiana Total</i>					101.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
Coshocton	Christine Sycks				
		104	2/3/2012	What to Expect for 2012 with Legislature?	1.5
		113	3/2/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		114	3/2/2012	Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		126	3/14/2012	New Options for Legal Advertising	2.5
		133	4/3/2012	Financial Accounting	50
		134	4/3/2012	General Ledger Software	30
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		147	5/4/2012	Impact of HB 14 - Dangerous Dogs	1
		148	5/4/2012	Ohio's Housing Markets, Why Data Matters	0.5
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		234	2/8/2013	Biennial State Budget - OBM Perspective	1.25
		240	3/8/2013	Update on State Bienial Budget w/ Rep. Amstutz	1
		247	4/12/2013	Updates from BTA and Dept of Taxation	1.75
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		303	9/13/2013	Changes in Dog Licensing Laws	1
		309	10/4/2013	A.L.I.C.E. Training	1.25
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		331	11/14/2012	Certified Public Records Training	3
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		355	1/31/2014	View from the Statehouse/ Leg Update	1
		359	12/31/2013	Payroll Accounting	42.5
		360	12/31/2013	Introductory Managerial Accounting	42.5
		363	4/4/2014	Update from Tax Commissioner	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		392	7/23/2014	GASB 68 Forum	1.5
		401	9/12/2014	Preparing for Life's Curves	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		407	10/3/2014	131st General Assembly Priorities	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
				<i>Coshocton Total</i>	266.25
Crawford	Robin Hildebrand				
		131	3/23/2012	School District Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		132	3/23/2012	GIS in Erie County	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		155	5/25/2012	Legislative issues	2
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		233	1/25/2013	Aspects of Appraisal Performance	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		308	9/27/2013	Social Media & Technology in Workplace	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		369	4/25/2014	How BTA is Affecting BOR & Cases	1.75
		447	2/27/2015	Items to Consider with a New Term of Office	1
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
				Crawford Total	45.75
Cuyahoga	Mark A. Parks, Jr.				
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
<i>Cuyahoga Total</i>					32.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
Darke	Carol Ginn				
		1	3/16/2011	* Ohio Ethics Seminar	1
		129	3/16/2012	2012 Ohio Farm Bureau Agenda	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		153	5/18/2012	Atty Gen Local Government Debt Collection Pr	1
		16	5/16/2011	Emerging Trenda in Fraud Investigation	15
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		174	7/20/2012	Local Government Forum: Municipalities, Twnh	2
		18	5/20/2011	State Budget Update	1
		191	9/24/2012	School Funding Present and Future	1
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		232	1/18/2013	Expedited Foreclosure	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		292	7/19/2013	Discussion of Biennial Budget	1
		305	9/20/2013	Housing Trends & Choices in SW Ohio	1
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		373	5/16/2014	ADAMH Boards and Local Government in Ohio	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		409	10/17/2014	* Cole's Warriors - No Second Chances	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		43	7/22/2011	Montgomery County Reappraisal	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		438	1/16/2015	BOR Reform Discussion	1
		46	8/4/2011	Advanced GAAP Accounting Seminar	16
		50	9/16/2011	CAUV Qualification	1
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				<i>Darke Total</i>	145.5
Defiance	Marlene J. Goodwin				
		131	3/23/2012	School District Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		132	3/23/2012	GIS in Erie County	1
		146	4/27/2012	Fundamentals of Weights & Measures & Leg Up	2

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		185	8/24/2012	The Appraisal and After the BOR is Filed	1.25
		19	5/20/2011	Board of Tax Appeals	1
		208	11/5/2012	* USPAP Review	7
		209	5/9/2012	* Supervisory Drug Free Work Place	2
		210	5/18/2012	* Employee Drug Free WorkPlace	1
		211	7/27/2012	Appraisal of Land	30
		212	10/10/2012	* Standards of Practice & Professional Ethics	7
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		261	5/24/2013	State Budget Update	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		293	7/26/2013	Ohio Housing Marker - Look at Details	1
		3	3/25/2011	ODA Weights & Measures Training Program	0.75
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		314	10/25/2013	Legal Updates & Sen. Randy Gardner	1.75
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		439	1/23/2015	Auditor of State's Share Ohio	0.5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
		9	4/29/2011	Budget Updates State Rep. Goodwin	1.75
				Defiance Total	136
Delaware	George Kaitsa				
		105	2/10/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		106	2/10/2012	School Districts & Converting Inside Milage	0.75
		13	5/13/2011	Update on Ohio Weights & Measures Program	0.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		149	4/20/2012	Fundamentals of Mass Appraisal	30
		15	5/13/2011	Sticker Shock of CAUV Values Appraisal Ctys	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		174	7/20/2012	Local Government Forum: Municipalities, Twnh	2
		176	8/10/2012	MARCS Program	1.5
		194	10/12/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1.5
		201	10/1/2012	Ohio's New Oil Boom	5.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		231	1/11/2013	Legislative News and 2013 Priorities	1.5
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		249	4/12/2013	Solutions to Collecting Delinquent Prop Tax	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropriat	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		289	7/12/2013	Discussion on New State Budget HB 59	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		294	8/13/2013	Paperless Reappraisal	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		311	10/11/2013	ODNR Forestry Property Tax Laws	1.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		352	1/10/2014	Update from Local Legislators	0.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		364	4/11/2014	CAUV Discussion and Ohio Forest Ttax law	1.25
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		39	7/1/2011	Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal	30
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		392	7/23/2014	GASB 68 Forum	1.5
		401	9/12/2014	Preparing for Life's Curves	1.5
		408	10/10/2014	ODNR Presentaton - Hands on the Forest	1
		409	10/17/2014	* Cole's Warriors - No Second Chances	1
		410	10/24/2014	Forestry Issues	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		437	1/9/2015	District Priorities for 2015	1
		444	2/13/2015	BOR Rules and Procedures	2
		47	8/19/2011	Key provisions of Budget Bill, Shale Oil & GasT	1.75
		49	9/2/2011	Assessment Administration	16

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		54	9/8/2011	IRS Sminar	3
		63	10/14/2011	Economic Development of Gallipolis Ohio	0.75
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Delaware Total	236.25
Erie	Rick Jeffrey				
		1	3/16/2011	* Ohio Ethics Seminar	1
		103	1/27/2012	Inspirational Leadership in Profound Times	1.5
		131	3/23/2012	School District Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		132	3/23/2012	GIS in Erie County	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		155	5/25/2012	Legislative issues	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		185	8/24/2012	The Appraisal and After the BOR is Filed	1.25
		202	10/26/2012	Lucas County Land Bank	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		233	1/25/2013	Aspects of Appraisal Performance	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		251	4/26/2013	State Biennial Budget & Legislative Update	1.25
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropriat	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		293	7/26/2013	Ohio Housing Marker - Look at Details	1
		295	8/15/2013	Paperless Reappraisal	3.5
		299	8/23/2013	Fraud Prevention: A Proactive Approach	1
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		308	9/27/2013	Social Media & Technology in Workplace	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		362	3/28/2014	Classified and Unclassified Positions	1
		369	4/25/2014	How BTA is Affecting BOR & Cases	1.75
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		393	7/25/2014	Qualities of Leadership	1
		394	8/1/2014	Fundamentals of Mass Appraisal	30
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		410	10/24/2014	Forestry Issues	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		447	2/27/2015	Items to Consider with a New Term of Office	1
		56	9/23/2011	Wyandot County Regional Planning - Solar Arra	1.25
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Erie Total	171
Fairfield	Jon Slater				
		1	3/16/2011	* Ohio Ethics Seminar	1
		105	2/10/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		106	2/10/2012	School Districts & Converting Inside Milage	0.75
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		15	5/13/2011	Sticker Shock of CAUV Values Appraisal Ctys	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		194	10/12/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		231	1/11/2013	Legislative News and 2013 Priorities	1.5
		238	2/22/2013	Tax Policy and Rights to Appeal	7
		248	4/12/2013	Recent Developments in BOR Process	1
		249	4/12/2013	Solutions to Collecting Delinquent Prop Tax	0.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		311	10/11/2013	ODNR Forestry Property Tax Laws	1.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		352	1/10/2014	Update from Local Legislators	0.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		364	4/11/2014	CAUV Discussion and Ohio Forest Ttax law	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		408	10/10/2014	ODNR Presentaton - Hands on the Forest	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Differennt Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		437	1/9/2015	District Priorities for 2015	1
		444	2/13/2015	BOR Rules and Procedures	2
		49	9/2/2011	Assessment Administration	8
		63	10/14/2011	Economic Development of Gallipolis Ohio	0.75
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Fairfield Total	125.5
Fayette	Michael D. Smith				
		102	1/20/2012	Weights & Measures Issues	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		18	5/20/2011	State Budget Update	1
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		309	10/4/2013	A.L.I.C.E. Training	1.25
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		43	7/22/2011	Montgomery County Reappraisal	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Fayette Total	69.75
Franklin	Clarence E. Mingo II				
		1	3/16/2011	* Ohio Ethics Seminar	1
		135	4/13/2012	Valuation of Public Utility Pipelines & Railroads	1.25
		136	4/13/2012	Appraiser Standards Legislation	0.25
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
				Franklin Total	25.5
Fulton	Brett J. Kolb				
		131	3/23/2012	School District Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		132	3/23/2012	GIS in Erie County	1
		146	4/27/2012	Fundamentals of Weights & Measures & Leg Up	2
		155	5/25/2012	Legislative issues	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		175	7/26/2012	School Funding Present & Future	1
		185	8/24/2012	The Appraisal and After the BOR is Filed	1.25
		19	5/20/2011	Board of Tax Appeals	1
		192	9/27/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		233	1/25/2013	Aspects of Appraisal Performance	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		245	3/22/2013	Recent Developments in Board of Revision Proc	1.25
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		261	5/24/2013	State Budget Update	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		3	3/25/2011	ODA Weights & Measures Training Program	0.75
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		374	5/16/2014	Appraising Your Appraiser & Future of CAUV	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		399	8/22/2014	Professionalism Ohio Weights & Measures Offic	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		439	1/23/2015	Auditor of State's Share Ohio	0.5
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Fulton Total	130.5
Gallia	Larry M. Betz				
		105	2/10/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		106	2/10/2012	School Districts & Converting Inside Milage	0.75
		13	5/13/2011	Update on Ohio Weights & Measures Program	0.25
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		15	5/13/2011	Sticker Shock of CAUV Values Appraisal Ctys	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		194	10/12/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1.5
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		231	1/11/2013	Legislative News and 2013 Priorities	1.5
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		248	4/12/2013	Recent Developments in BOR Process	1
		249	4/12/2013	Solutions to Collecting Delinquent Prop Tax	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		289	7/12/2013	Discussion on New State Budget HB 59	1.5
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		311	10/11/2013	ODNR Forestry Property Tax Laws	1.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		352	1/10/2014	Update from Local Legislators	0.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		364	4/11/2014	CAUV Discussion and Ohio Forest Ttax law	1.25
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Differennt Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		444	2/13/2015	BOR Rules and Procedures	2
		47	8/19/2011	Key provisions of Budget Bill, Shale Oil & GasT	1.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		63	10/14/2011	Economic Development of Gallipolis Ohio	0.75
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Gallia Total	113.25
Geauga	Frank Gliha				
		104	2/3/2012	What to Expect for 2012 with Legislature?	1.5
		11	5/6/2011	Report from Office of Auditor of State	0.75
		113	3/2/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		114	3/2/2012	Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		147	5/4/2012	Impact of HB 14 - Dangerous Dogs	1
		148	5/4/2012	Ohio's Housing Markets, Why Data Matters	0.5
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		172	7/6/2012	Fracking and Your Drinking Water	1.5
		189	9/14/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities and Update	1
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		234	2/8/2013	Biennial State Budget - OBM Perspective	1.25
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		240	3/8/2013	Update on State Biennial Budget w/ Rep. Amstutz	1
		247	4/12/2013	Updates from BTA and Dept of Taxation	1.75
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		288	7/12/2013	Perspectives on Ohio's New Budget	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		355	1/31/2014	View from the Statehouse/ Leg Update	1
		356	3/7/2014	Programs Provided at MCCTC	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		363	4/4/2014	Update from Tax Commissioner	1.5
		368	4/17/2014	GASB 68 Forum	1.5
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		371	5/23/2014	Certified Public Records Training	3
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		401	9/12/2014	Preparing for Life's Curves	1.5
		407	10/3/2014	131st General Assembly Priorities	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		440	1/30/2015	GIS in CAUV Field Verification	1
		45	8/5/2011	Paperless Reappraisal, Timing of Reapp, OSIP FI	1.5
		62	10/14/2011	Taxation of Oil and Gas Reserves	1.5
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
				Geauga Total	136
Greene	David Graham				
		1	3/16/2011	* Ohio Ethics Seminar	1
		102	1/20/2012	Weights & Measures Issues	1
		129	3/16/2012	2012 Ohio Farm Bureau Agenda	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		153	5/18/2012	Atty Gen Local Government Debt Collection Pr	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		232	1/18/2013	Expedited Foreclosure	1
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		259	5/17/2013	CAAO Mission, Policy., Collaboration with CA	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		292	7/19/2013	Discussion of Biennial Budget	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		305	9/20/2013	Housing Trends & Choices in SW Ohio	1
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		43	7/22/2011	Montgomery County Reappraisal	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		438	1/16/2015	BOR Reform Discussion	1
		50	9/16/2011	CAUV Qualification	1
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
<i>Greene Total</i>					134.75
Guernsey	Anthony Brown				
		13	5/13/2011	Update on Ohio Weights & Measures Program	0.25
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		15	5/13/2011	Sticker Shock of CAUV Values Appraisal Ctys	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		289	7/12/2013	Discussion on New State Budget HB 59	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		352	1/10/2014	Update from Local Legislators	0.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Differennt Types of Deeds	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		444	2/13/2015	BOR Rules and Procedures	2
		47	8/19/2011	Key provisions of Budget Bill, Shale Oil & GasT	1.75
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Guernsey Total	75
Hamilton	Dusty Rhodes				
		153	5/18/2012	Atty Gen Local Government Debt Collection Pr	1
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		174	7/20/2012	Local Government Forum: Municipalities, Twnh	2
		18	5/20/2011	State Budget Update	1
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		259	5/17/2013	CAAO Mission, Policy., Collaboration with CA	1.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		353	1/17/2014	Butler County Web Portal	1
		391	7/18/2014	Mt. Orab Police Department Canine Unit	1
		438	1/16/2015	BOR Reform Discussion	1
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		71	11/18/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		86	12/14/2011	* Substance Abuse	1
				<i>Hamilton Total</i>	43.25
Hancock	Charity A. Rauschenb				
		1	3/16/2011	* Ohio Ethics Seminar	1
		131	3/23/2012	School District Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		132	3/23/2012	GIS in Erie County	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		146	4/27/2012	Fundamentals of Weights & Measures & Leg Up	2
		155	5/25/2012	Legislative issues	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		174	7/20/2012	Local Government Forum: Municipalities, Twnh	2
		175	7/26/2012	School Funding Present & Future	1
		185	8/24/2012	The Appraisal and After the BOR is Filed	1.25
		19	5/20/2011	Board of Tax Appeals	1
		192	9/27/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1
		202	10/26/2012	Lucas County Land Bank	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		233	1/25/2013	Aspects of Appraisal Performance	1
		245	3/22/2013	Recent Developments in Board of Revision Proc	1.25
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		3	3/25/2011	ODA Weights & Measures Training Program	0.75
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		302	8/28/2013	2013 IAAO Conference	11.5
		304	9/13/2013	Ohio GFOA 2013 Conference	12
		307	9/13/2013	* Professional Standards, Ohio Ethics	3
		308	9/27/2013	Social Media & Technology in Workplace	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		362	3/28/2014	Classified and Unclassified Positions	1
		374	5/16/2014	Appraising Your Appraiser & Future of CAUV	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		393	7/25/2014	Qualities of Leadership	1
		395	7/31/2014	GASB 68 Forum	1.5
		399	8/22/2014	Professionalism Ohio Weights & Measures Offic	1
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		410	10/24/2014	Forestry Issues	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Differennt Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		439	1/23/2015	Auditor of State's Share Ohio	0.5
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
		9	4/29/2011	Budget Updates State Rep. Goodwin	1.75
				Hancock Total	171.25
Hardin	Michael T. Bacon				
		111	1/24/2012	* Unlawful Discrimination & Harassment Training	2
		155	5/25/2012	Legislative issues	2
		174	7/20/2012	Local Government Forum: Municipalities, Twnh	2
		175	7/26/2012	School Funding Present & Future	1
		19	5/20/2011	Board of Tax Appeals	1
		260	5/22/2013	Disciplining the Difficult Employee	2
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		293	7/26/2013	Ohio Housing Marker - Look at Details	1
		3	3/25/2011	ODA Weights & Measures Training Program	0.75
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		38	6/14/2011	Risk Management Seminar	4.5
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		56	9/23/2011	Wyandot County Regional Planning - Solar Arra	1.25
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
Hardin Total					59

Harrison Patrick J. Moore

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		104	2/3/2012	What to Expect for 2012 with Legislature?	1.5
		11	5/6/2011	Report from Office of Auditor of State	0.75
		113	3/2/2012	Foreclosure Preventionin Your County	0.5
		114	3/2/2012	Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		189	9/14/2012	CAAO Legislative Prioirites and Update	1
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropriat	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		303	9/13/2013	Changes in Dog Licensing Laws	1
		309	10/4/2013	A.L.I.C.E. Training	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		355	1/31/2014	View from the Statehouse/ Leg Update	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		407	10/3/2014	131st General Assembly Priorities	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		45	8/5/2011	Paperless Reappraisal, Timing of Reapp, OSIP FI	1.5
		47	8/19/2011	Key provisions of Budget Bill, Shale Oil & GasT	1.75
		62	10/14/2011	Taxation of Oil and Gas Reserves	1.5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
<i>Harrison Total</i>					96.5
Henry	Kevin Garringer				
		103	1/27/2012	Inspirational Leadership in Profound Times	1.5
		131	3/23/2012	School District Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		132	3/23/2012	GIS in Erie County	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		146	4/27/2012	Fundamentals of Weights & Measures & Leg Up	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		185	8/24/2012	The Appraisal and After the BOR is Filed	1.25
		192	9/27/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1
		202	10/26/2012	Lucas County Land Bank	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		233	1/25/2013	Aspects of Appraisal Performance	1
		242	10/5/2012	Certified Public Records Training	3
		245	3/22/2013	Recent Developments in Board of Revision Proc	1.25
		251	4/26/2013	State Biennial Budget & Legislative Update	1.25
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		293	7/26/2013	Ohio Housing Marker - Look at Details	1
		299	8/23/2013	Fraud Prevention: A Proactive Approach	1
		308	9/27/2013	Social Media & Technology in Workplace	1.25
		314	10/25/2013	Legal Updates & Sen. Randy Gardner	1.75
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		362	3/28/2014	Classified and Unclassified Positions	1
		369	4/25/2014	How BTA is Affecting BOR & Cases	1.75
		374	5/16/2014	Appraising Your Appraiser & Future of CAUV	1
		379	9/13/2013	Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal	30
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		395	7/31/2014	GASB 68 Forum	1.5
		399	8/22/2014	Professionalism Ohio Weights & Measures Offic	1
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		410	10/24/2014	Forestry Issues	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Differennt Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		439	1/23/2015	Auditor of State's Share Ohio	0.5
				Henry Total	147.25
Highland	Bill Fawley				
		1	3/16/2011	* Ohio Ethics Seminar	1
		102	1/20/2012	Weights & Measures Issues	1
		129	3/16/2012	2012 Ohio Farm Bureau Agenda	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		153	5/18/2012	Atty Gen Local Government Debt Collection Pr	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		174	7/20/2012	Local Government Forum: Municipalities, Twnh	2
		18	5/20/2011	State Budget Update	1
		191	9/24/2012	School Funding Present and Future	1
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		232	1/18/2013	Expedited Foreclosure	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		241	3/15/2013	What Can Financial Forecasting do for Local Go	1
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		259	5/17/2013	CAAO Mission, Policy., Collaboration with CA	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		305	9/20/2013	Housing Trends & Choices in SW Ohio	1
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		353	1/17/2014	Butler County Web Portal	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		373	5/16/2014	ADAMH Boards and Local Government in Ohio	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		43	7/22/2011	Montgomery County Reappraisal	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		438	1/16/2015	BOR Reform Discussion	1
		50	9/16/2011	CAUV Qualification	1
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
				<i>Highland Total</i>	112.25
Hocking	Kenneth R. Wilson				
		105	2/10/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		106	2/10/2012	School Districts & Converting Inside Milage	0.75
		129	3/16/2012	2012 Ohio Farm Bureau Agenda	1
		13	5/13/2011	Update on Ohio Weights & Measures Program	0.25
		135	4/13/2012	Valuation of Public Utility Pipelines & Railroads	1.25
		136	4/13/2012	Appraiser Standards Legislation	0.25
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		145	10/6/2011	* Safety Training	3.5
		15	5/13/2011	Sticker Shock of CAUV Values Appraisal Ctys	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		176	8/10/2012	MARCS Program	1.5
		194	10/12/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		231	1/11/2013	Legislative News and 2013 Priorities	1.5
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		248	4/12/2013	Recent Developments in BOR Process	1
		249	4/12/2013	Solutions to Collecting Delinquent Prop Tax	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		254	10/6/2011	* Dealing with Drugs	1
		255	10/3/2012	* Prescription Use & Abuse	1
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		289	7/12/2013	Discussion on New State Budget HB 59	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		311	10/11/2013	ODNR Forestry Property Tax Laws	1.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		352	1/10/2014	Update from Local Legislators	0.5
		364	4/11/2014	CAUV Discussion and Ohio Forest Tax law	1.25
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		388	6/23/2014	USPAP Update	7
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		392	7/23/2014	GASB 68 Forum	1.5
		408	10/10/2014	ODNR Presentaton - Hands on the Forest	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		437	1/9/2015	District Priorities for 2015	1
		47	8/19/2011	Key provisions of Budget Bill, Shale Oil & GasT	1.75
		49	9/2/2011	Assessment Administration	30
		63	10/14/2011	Economic Development of Gallipolis Ohio	0.75
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
Hocking Total					175.25
Holmes	Jackie McKee				
		104	2/3/2012	What to Expect for 2012 with Legislature?	1.5
		113	3/2/2012	Foreclosure Preventionin Your County	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		114	3/2/2012	Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		147	5/4/2012	Impact of HB 14 - Dangerous Dogs	1
		148	5/4/2012	Ohio's Housing Markets, Why Data Matters	0.5
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		21	6/3/2011	Management in Challenging Financial Times	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		240	3/8/2013	Update on State Bienial Budget w/ Rep. Amstutz	1
		247	4/12/2013	Updates from BTA and Dept of Taxation	1.75
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		303	9/13/2013	Changes in Dog Licensing Laws	1
		309	10/4/2013	A.L.I.C.E. Training	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		401	9/12/2014	Preparing for Life's Curves	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		436	11/3/2014	Working with Angry and Irate People	3
		440	1/30/2015	GIS in CAUV Field Verification	1
		62	10/14/2011	Taxation of Oil and Gas Reserves	1.5
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
Holmes Total					102.75
Huron	Roland Tkach				
		1	3/16/2011	* Ohio Ethics Seminar	1
		131	3/23/2012	School District Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		132	3/23/2012	GIS in Erie County	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		175	7/26/2012	School Funding Present & Future	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		19	5/20/2011	Board of Tax Appeals	1
		192	9/27/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1
		202	10/26/2012	Lucas County Land Bank	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		233	1/25/2013	Aspects of Appraisal Performance	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		247	4/12/2013	Updates from BTA and Dept of Taxation	1.75
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		293	7/26/2013	Ohio Housing Marker - Look at Details	1
		299	8/23/2013	Fraud Prevention: A Proactive Approach	1
		3	3/25/2011	ODA Weights & Measures Training Program	0.75
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		351	12/13/2013	Mass Appraisal Course	30
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		362	3/28/2014	Classified and Unclassified Positions	1
		363	4/4/2014	Update from Tax Commissioner	1.5
		369	4/25/2014	How BTA is Affecting BOR & Cases	1.75
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		374	5/16/2014	Appraising Your Appraiser & Future of CAUV	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		393	7/25/2014	Qualities of Leadership	1
		399	8/22/2014	Professionalism Ohio Weights & Measures Offic	1
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Differennt Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		439	1/23/2015	Auditor of State's Share Ohio	0.5
		447	2/27/2015	Items to Consider with a New Term of Office	1
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
<i>Huron Total</i>					183.5
Jackson	Clyde Holdren				
		13	5/13/2011	Update on Ohio Weights & Measures Program	0.25
		135	4/13/2012	Valuation of Public Utility Pipelines & Railroads	1.25
		136	4/13/2012	Appraiser Standards Legislation	0.25
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		15	5/13/2011	Sticker Shock of CAUV Values Appraisal Ctys	1
		176	8/10/2012	MARCS Program	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Jackson Total	82.25
Jefferson	Patrick J. Marshall				
		10	5/3/2011	Financial Statement Fraud	16
		11	5/6/2011	Report from Office of Auditor of State	0.75
		156	5/21/2012	* Ethics in Business & Government	2.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		16	5/16/2011	Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation	15
		172	7/6/2012	Fracking and Your Drinking Water	1.5
		184	8/16/2012	Certified Public Records	3
		189	9/14/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities and Update	1
		193	10/2/2012	* Operation Street Smart	4
		288	7/12/2013	Perspectives on Ohio's New Budget	1.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		401	9/12/2014	Preparing for Life's Curves	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
				Jefferson Total	65.25
Knox	Jonette Curry				
		104	2/3/2012	What to Expect for 2012 with Legislature?	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		113	3/2/2012	Foreclosure Preventionin Your County	0.5
		114	3/2/2012	Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		147	5/4/2012	Impact of HB 14 - Dangerous Dogs	1
		148	5/4/2012	Ohio's Housing Markets, Why Data Matters	0.5
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		172	7/6/2012	Fracking and Your Drinking Water	1.5
		189	9/14/2012	CAAO Legislative Prioirites and Update	1
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		247	4/12/2013	Updates from BTA and Dept of Taxation	1.75
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		288	7/12/2013	Perspectives on Ohio's New Budget	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		303	9/13/2013	Changes in Dog Licensing Laws	1
		309	10/4/2013	A.L.I.C.E. Training	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	1.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		356	3/7/2014	Programs Provided at MCCTC	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		363	4/4/2014	Update from Tax Commissioner	1.5
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		372	5/2/2014	What is the Open Data Initiative?	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		401	9/12/2014	Preparing for Life's Curves	1.5
		407	10/3/2014	131st General Assembly Priorities	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		44	7/7/2011	Ohio Public Records & Open Meetings laws	3
		440	1/30/2015	GIS in CAUV Field Verification	1
		62	10/14/2011	Taxation of Oil and Gas Reserves	1.5
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	1
<i>Knox Total</i>					135.25
Lake	Edward H. Zupancic				
		113	3/2/2012	Foreclosure Preventionin Your County	0.5
		114	3/2/2012	Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		247	4/12/2013	Updates from BTA and Dept of Taxation	1.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		295	8/15/2013	Paperless Reappraisal	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		309	10/4/2013	A.L.I.C.E. Training	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	1.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		62	10/14/2011	Taxation of Oil and Gas Reserves	1.5
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				<i>Lake Total</i>	93.25
Lawrence	Jason C Stephens				
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		248	4/12/2013	Recent Developments in BOR Process	1
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		444	2/13/2015	BOR Rules and Procedures	2
		63	10/14/2011	Economic Development of Gallipolis Ohio	0.75
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
<i>Lawrence Total</i>					93.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
Licking	Michael Smith				
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		231	1/11/2013	Legislative News and 2013 Priorities	1.5
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		248	4/12/2013	Recent Developments in BOR Process	1
		249	4/12/2013	Solutions to Collecting Delinquent Prop Tax	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		352	1/10/2014	Update from Local Legislators	0.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		437	1/9/2015	District Priorities for 2015	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	2.5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Licking Total	87.25
Logan	Mike Yoder				
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		174	7/20/2012	Local Government Forum: Municipalities, Twnh	2
		175	7/26/2012	School Funding Present & Future	1
		191	9/24/2012	School Funding Present and Future	1
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		232	1/18/2013	Expedited Foreclosure	1
		241	3/15/2013	What Can Financial Forecasting do for Local Go	1
		259	5/17/2013	CAAO Mission, Policy., Collaboration with CA	1.5
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		292	7/19/2013	Discussion of Biennial Budget	1
		305	9/20/2013	Housing Trends & Choices in SW Ohio	1
		309	10/4/2013	A.L.I.C.E. Training	1.25
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		373	5/16/2014	ADAMH Boards and Local Government in Ohio	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		400	8/27/2014	Certified Public Records Training	3
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		409	10/17/2014	* Cole's Warriors - No Second Chances	1
		410	10/24/2014	Forestry Issues	1
		422	12/17/2014	Harassment in the Public Sector	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		438	1/16/2015	BOR Reform Discussion	1
				Logan Total	101.5
Lorain	J. Craig Snodgrass				
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		294	8/13/2013	Paperless Reappraisal	3.5
		309	10/4/2013	A.L.I.C.E. Training	1.25
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		327	5/30/2013	Professional Issues Update	4
		328	7/12/2013	* Ethis Law Webinar	1
		329	8/8/2013	Advanced GAAP Accounting Seminar	16
		330	8/21/2013	Accounting & Auditing Update	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		363	4/4/2014	Update from Tax Commissioner	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
				Lorain Total	59.25
Lucas	Anita Lopez				
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	0.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		202	10/26/2012	Lucas County Land Bank	1.5
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		3	3/25/2011	ODA Weights & Measures Training Program	0.75
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		439	1/23/2015	Auditor of State's Share Ohio	0.5
		447	2/27/2015	Items to Consider with a New Term of Office	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		9	4/29/2011	Budget Updates State Rep. Goodwin	1.75
				Lucas Total	50
Madison	Jennifer Hunter				
		102	1/20/2012	Weights & Measures Issues	1
		153	5/18/2012	Atty Gen Local Government Debt Collection Pr	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		174	7/20/2012	Local Government Forum: Municipalities, Twnh	2
		18	5/20/2011	State Budget Update	1
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		305	9/20/2013	Housing Trends & Choices in SW Ohio	1
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		353	1/17/2014	Butler County Web Portal	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		373	5/16/2014	ADAMH Boards and Local Government in Ohio	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		391	7/18/2014	Mt. Orab Police Department Canine Unit	1
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		409	10/17/2014	* Cole's Warriors - No Second Chances	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		43	7/22/2011	Montgomery County Reappraisal	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		438	1/16/2015	BOR Reform Discussion	1
		49	9/2/2011	Assessment Administration	8
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Madison Total	132.75
Mahoning	Michael Sciortino				
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		189	9/14/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities and Update	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		356	3/7/2014	Programs Provided at MCCTC	1
		363	4/4/2014	Update from Tax Commissioner	1.5
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
				<i>Mahoning Total</i>	44
Marion	Joan Kasotis				
		103	1/27/2012	Inspirational Leadership in Profound Times	1.5
		115	3/1/2012	Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal	30
		131	3/23/2012	School District Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		132	3/23/2012	GIS in Erie County	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		146	4/27/2012	Fundamentals of Weights & Measures & Leg Up	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		175	7/26/2012	School Funding Present & Future	1
		185	8/24/2012	The Appraisal and After the BOR is Filed	1.25
		19	5/20/2011	Board of Tax Appeals	1
		192	9/27/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1
		202	10/26/2012	Lucas County Land Bank	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		233	1/25/2013	Aspects of Appraisal Performance	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		251	4/26/2013	State Biennial Budget & Legislative Update	1.25
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		261	5/24/2013	State Budget Update	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		293	7/26/2013	Ohio Housing Marker - Look at Details	1
		299	8/23/2013	Fraud Prevention: A Proactive Approach	1
		3	3/25/2011	ODA Weights & Measures Training Program	0.75
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		308	9/27/2013	Social Media & Technology in Workplace	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		362	3/28/2014	Classified and Unclassified Positions	1
		369	4/25/2014	How BTA is Affecting BOR & Cases	1.75
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		374	5/16/2014	Appraising Your Appraiser & Future of CAUV	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		410	10/24/2014	Forestry Issues	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		447	2/27/2015	Items to Consider with a New Term of Office	1
		56	9/23/2011	Wyandot County Regional Planning - Solar Arra	1.25
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
		9	4/29/2011	Budget Updates State Rep. Goodwin	1.75
				Marion Total	182
Medina	Michael E. Kovack				
		104	2/3/2012	What to Expect for 2012 with Legislature?	1.5
		105	2/10/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		106	2/10/2012	School Districts & Converting Inside Millage	0.75
		11	5/6/2011	Report from Office of Auditor of State	0.75
		113	3/2/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		114	3/2/2012	Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		147	5/4/2012	Impact of HB 14 - Dangerous Dogs	1
		148	5/4/2012	Ohio's Housing Markets, Why Data Matters	0.5
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		172	7/6/2012	Fracking and Your Drinking Water	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		234	2/8/2013	Biennial State Budget - OBM Perspective	1.25
		240	3/8/2013	Update on State Bienial Budget w/ Rep. Amstutz	1
		247	4/12/2013	Updates from BTA and Dept of Taxation	1.75
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		288	7/12/2013	Perspectives on Ohio's New Budget	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		313	9/16/2013	Mass Appraisal Class	30

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		355	1/31/2014	View from the Statehouse/ Leg Update	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		363	4/4/2014	Update from Tax Commissioner	1.5
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		440	1/30/2015	GIS in CAUV Field Verification	1
		45	8/5/2011	Paperless Reappraisal, Timing of Reapp, OSIP FI	1.5
		62	10/14/2011	Taxation of Oil and Gas Reserves	1.5
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
Medina Total					144.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
Meigs	Mary Hill				
		105	2/10/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		106	2/10/2012	School Districts & Converting Inside Milage	0.75
		13	5/13/2011	Update on Ohio Weights & Measures Program	0.25
		135	4/13/2012	Valuation of Public Utility Pipelines & Railroads	1.25
		136	4/13/2012	Appraiser Standards Legislation	0.25
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		15	5/13/2011	Sticker Shock of CAUV Values Appraisal Ctys	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		176	8/10/2012	MARCS Program	1.5
		194	10/12/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		231	1/11/2013	Legislative News and 2013 Priorities	1.5
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		248	4/12/2013	Recent Developments in BOR Process	1
		249	4/12/2013	Solutions to Collecting Delinquent Prop Tax	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		311	10/11/2013	ODNR Forestry Property Tax Laws	1.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		352	1/10/2014	Update from Local Legislators	0.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		364	4/11/2014	CAUV Discussion and Ohio Forest Tax law	1.25
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		408	10/10/2014	ODNR Presentaton - Hands on the Forest	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Differennt Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		437	1/9/2015	District Priorities for 2015	1
		444	2/13/2015	BOR Rules and Procedures	2
		47	8/19/2011	Key provisions of Budget Bill, Shale Oil & GasT	1.75
		63	10/14/2011	Economic Development of Gallipolis Ohio	0.75
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Meigs Total	127
Mercer	Randy Grapner				
		103	1/27/2012	Inspirational Leadership in Profound Times	1.5
		146	4/27/2012	Fundamentals of Weights & Measures & Leg Up	2
		155	5/25/2012	Legislative issues	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		174	7/20/2012	Local Government Forum: Municipalities, Twnh	2
		185	8/24/2012	The Appraisal and After the BOR is Filed	1.25
		19	5/20/2011	Board of Tax Appeals	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		238	2/22/2013	Tax Policy and Rights to Appeal	7
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		245	3/22/2013	Recent Developments in Board of Revision Proc	1.25
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		251	4/26/2013	State Biennial Budget & Legislative Update	1.25
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		261	5/24/2013	State Budget Update	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		292	7/19/2013	Discussion of Biennial Budget	1
		3	3/25/2011	ODA Weights & Measures Training Program	0.75
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		308	9/27/2013	Social Media & Technology in Workplace	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		314	10/25/2013	Legal Updates & Sen. Randy Gardner	1.75
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		362	3/28/2014	Classified and Unclassified Positions	1
		369	4/25/2014	How BTA is Affecting BOR & Cases	1.75
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		374	5/16/2014	Appraising Your Appraiser & Future of CAUV	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		399	8/22/2014	Professionalism Ohio Weights & Measures Offic	1
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		410	10/24/2014	Forestry Issues	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		439	1/23/2015	Auditor of State's Share Ohio	0.5
		56	9/23/2011	Wyandot County Regional Planning - Solar Arra	1.25
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
		9	4/29/2011	Budget Updates State Rep. Goodwin	1.75
				<i>Mercer Total</i>	163.75
Miami	Matthew W. Gearhard				
		129	3/16/2012	2012 Ohio Farm Bureau Agenda	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		18	5/20/2011	State Budget Update	1
		191	9/24/2012	School Funding Present and Future	1
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		232	1/18/2013	Expedited Foreclosure	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropriat	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		305	9/20/2013	Housing Trends & Choices in SW Ohio	1
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Differennt Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		50	9/16/2011	CAUV Qualification	1
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
				Miami Total	72.5
Monroe	Pandora J. Neuhart				
		105	2/10/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		106	2/10/2012	School Districts & Converting Inside Milage	0.75
		116	1/24/2012	Oil & Gas Drilling - Impact on Monroe County	1.5
		13	5/13/2011	Update on Ohio Weights & Measures Program	0.25
		135	4/13/2012	Valuation of Public Utility Pipelines & Railroads	1.25
		136	4/13/2012	Appraiser Standards Legislation	0.25
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		15	5/13/2011	Sticker Shock of CAUV Values Appraisal Ctys	1
		186	8/23/2012	* Ohio's Ethics Laws	2
		248	4/12/2013	Recent Developments in BOR Process	1
		249	4/12/2013	Solutions to Collecting Delinquent Prop Tax	0.5
		256	12/4/2012	Certified Public Records Training	3
		352	1/10/2014	Update from Local Legislators	0.5
		411	9/27/2014	* Drug Prevention and Education	1
		412	9/18/2014	* Prevent Employment Claims	1.5
		413	8/12/2014	Defensive Driving Course	4
		444	2/13/2015	BOR Rules and Procedures	2

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		47	8/19/2011	Key provisions of Budget Bill, Shale Oil & GasT	1.75
		48	8/11/2011	* 2011 Trustee Conference	5
		52	8/16/2011	Shale Development Local Govt. Questions	2.5
		53	9/15/2011	Tour of Marcellus/Utica Well Site	2.5
				<i>Monroe Total</i>	33.75
Montgomery	Karl Keith				
		102	1/20/2012	Weights & Measures Issues	1
		129	3/16/2012	2012 Ohio Farm Bureau Agenda	1
		130	3/20/2012	State of Real Estate in Miami Valley 2012	3.5
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		153	5/18/2012	Atty Gen Local Government Debt Collection Pr	1
		155	5/25/2012	Legislative issues	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		18	5/20/2011	State Budget Update	1
		191	9/24/2012	School Funding Present and Future	1
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		202	10/26/2012	Lucas County Land Bank	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		205	7/22/2012	Reclaiming Vacant Properties	14.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		232	1/18/2013	Expedited Foreclosure	1
		245	3/22/2013	Recent Developments in Board of Revision Proc	1.25
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		292	7/19/2013	Discussion of Biennial Budget	1
		305	9/20/2013	Housing Trends & Choices in SW Ohio	1
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		353	1/17/2014	Butler County Web Portal	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		366	11/13/2013	Taste of IT 2013 Conference	8
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		43	7/22/2011	Montgomery County Reappraisal	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		438	1/16/2015	BOR Reform Discussion	1
		50	9/16/2011	CAUV Qualification	1
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Montgomery Total	142.75
Morgan	Gary D. Woodward				
		13	5/13/2011	Update on Ohio Weights & Measures Program	0.25
		135	4/13/2012	Valuation of Public Utility Pipelines & Railroads	11.3

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		136	4/13/2012	Appraiser Standards Legislation	0.25
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		194	10/12/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1.5
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		289	7/12/2013	Discussion on New State Budget HB 59	1.5
		311	10/11/2013	ODNR Forestry Property Tax Laws	1.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		352	1/10/2014	Update from Local Legislators	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		365	4/9/2014	BWC Hot Topics, Managed Care, Accident Repo	3
		417	11/18/2014	* Overview of the Ethics law	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		446	12/4/2012	Certified Public Records Training	3
		47	8/19/2011	Key provisions of Budget Bill, Shale Oil & GasT	1.75
				Morgan Total	57
Morrow	Mary M. Holtrey				
		103	1/27/2012	Inspirational Leadership in Profound Times	1.5
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		146	4/27/2012	Fundamentals of Weights & Measures & Leg Up	2
		155	5/25/2012	Legislative issues	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		175	7/26/2012	School Funding Present & Future	1
		177	10/3/2011	Sexual Harassment: Manager's Guide	1
		178	7/25/2012	Harassment in the Public Sector	1
		179	8/1/2012	Weights & Measures Training	10
		185	8/24/2012	The Appraisal and After the BOR is Filed	1.25
		19	5/20/2011	Board of Tax Appeals	1
		192	9/27/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1
		195	10/5/2012	Leadership Training	12
		197	10/17/2012	Certified Public Records	3
		203	10/29/2012	* Understanding the Addictive Process	3
		214	11/20/2012	Understanding the New ADA	1
		215	11/21/2012	Understanding the New FMLA	1
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		233	1/25/2013	Aspects of Appraisal Performance	1
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		293	7/26/2013	Ohio Housing Marker - Look at Details	1
		3	3/25/2011	ODA Weights & Measures Training Program	0.75
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		39	7/1/2011	Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal	30
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
		9	4/29/2011	Budget Updates State Rep. Goodwin	1.75
				<i>Morrow Total</i>	117.25
Muskingum	Debra J. Nye				
		105	2/10/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		106	2/10/2012	School Districts & Converting Inside Milage	0.75
		13	5/13/2011	Update on Ohio Weights & Measures Program	0.25
		135	4/13/2012	Valuation of Public Utility Pipelines & Railroads	1.25
		136	4/13/2012	Appraiser Standards Legislation	0.25
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		15	5/13/2011	Sticker Shock of CAUV Values Appraisal Ctys	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		194	10/12/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		231	1/11/2013	Legislative News and 2013 Priorities	1.5
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		289	7/12/2013	Discussion on New State Budget HB 59	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		352	1/10/2014	Update from Local Legislators	0.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		364	4/11/2014	CAUV Discussion and Ohio Forest Ttax law	1.25
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		39	7/1/2011	Fundamentals of Real Property Appraisal	30
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		408	10/10/2014	ODNR Presentaton - Hands on the Forest	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		437	1/9/2015	District Priorities for 2015	1
		444	2/13/2015	BOR Rules and Procedures	2
		47	8/19/2011	Key provisions of Budget Bill, Shale Oil & GasT	1.75
		63	10/14/2011	Economic Development of Gallipolis Ohio	0.75
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Muskingum Total	179
Noble	Peggy Davis				
		248	4/12/2013	Recent Developments in BOR Process	1
		249	4/12/2013	Solutions to Collecting Delinquent Prop Tax	0.5
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		289	7/12/2013	Discussion on New State Budget HB 59	1.5
		291	7/11/2013	* Can I Do That? Overview of Ohio Ethics	1
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		352	1/10/2014	Update from Local Legislators	0.5
		364	4/11/2014	CAUV Discussion and Ohio Forest Ttax law	1.25
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		392	7/23/2014	GASB 68 Forum	1.5
		408	10/10/2014	ODNR Presentaton - Hands on the Forest	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Differennt Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		444	2/13/2015	BOR Rules and Procedures	2
<i>Noble Total</i>					<i>52.5</i>
Ottawa	Larry Hartlaub				
		233	1/25/2013	Aspects of Appraisal Performance	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		251	4/26/2013	State Biennial Budget & Legislative Update	1.25
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropriat	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		293	7/26/2013	Ohio Housing Marker - Look at Details	1
		295	8/15/2013	Paperless Reappraisal	3.5
		299	8/23/2013	Fraud Prevention: A Proactive Approach	1
		306	9/5/2013	* Ohio Ethics Webinar	1
		314	10/25/2013	Legal Updates & Sen. Randy Gardner	1.75
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		319	9/29/2013	Certified Public Records Training	3
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		351	12/13/2013	Mass Appraisal Course	30
		374	5/16/2014	Appraising Your Appraiser & Future of CAUV	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		393	7/25/2014	Qualities of Leadership	1
		395	7/31/2014	GASB 68 Forum	1.5
		399	8/22/2014	Professionalism Ohio Weights & Measures Offic	1
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		439	1/23/2015	Auditor of State's Share Ohio	0.5
		447	2/27/2015	Items to Consider with a New Term of Office	1
				Ottawa Total	112.5
Paulding	Claudia Fickel				
		103	1/27/2012	Inspirational Leadership in Profound Times	1.5
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		146	4/27/2012	Fundamentals of Weights & Measures & Leg Up	2
		155	5/25/2012	Legislative issues	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		175	7/26/2012	School Funding Present & Future	1
		185	8/24/2012	The Appraisal and After the BOR is Filed	1.25
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		245	3/22/2013	Recent Developments in Board of Revision Proc	1.25
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		251	4/26/2013	State Biennial Budget & Legislative Update	1.25
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		261	5/24/2013	State Budget Update	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		3	3/25/2011	ODA Weights & Measures Training Program	0.75
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		308	9/27/2013	Social Media & Technology in Workplace	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		314	10/25/2013	Legal Updates & Sen. Randy Gardner	1.75
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		399	8/22/2014	Professionalism Ohio Weights & Measures Office	1
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		439	1/23/2015	Auditor of State's Share Ohio	0.5
		447	2/27/2015	Items to Consider with a New Term of Office	1
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		9	4/29/2011	Budget Updates State Rep. Goodwin	1.75
				<i>Paulding Total</i>	124.5
Perry	Teresa Stevenson				
		105	2/10/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		106	2/10/2012	School Districts & Converting Inside Milage	0.75
		13	5/13/2011	Update on Ohio Weights & Measures Program	0.25
		135	4/13/2012	Valuation of Public Utility Pipelines & Railroads	1.25
		136	4/13/2012	Appraiser Standards Legislation	0.25
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		15	5/13/2011	Sticker Shock of CAUV Values Appraisal Ctys	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		176	8/10/2012	MARCS Program	1.5
		194	10/12/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		231	1/11/2013	Legislative News and 2013 Priorities	1.5
		248	4/12/2013	Recent Developments in BOR Process	1
		249	4/12/2013	Solutions to Collecting Delinquent Prop Tax	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		311	10/11/2013	ODNR Forestry Property Tax Laws	1.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		352	1/10/2014	Update from Local Legislators	0.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		364	4/11/2014	CAUV Discussion and Ohio Forest Ttax law	1.25
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		408	10/10/2014	ODNR Presentaton - Hands on the Forest	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Differennt Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		437	1/9/2015	District Priorities for 2015	1
		444	2/13/2015	BOR Rules and Procedures	2
		47	8/19/2011	Key provisions of Budget Bill, Shale Oil & GasT	1.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		63	10/14/2011	Economic Development of Gallipolis Ohio	0.75
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				<i>Perry Total</i>	144.25
Pickaway	Melissa Betz				
		102	1/20/2012	Weights & Measures Issues	1
		129	3/16/2012	2012 Ohio Farm Bureau Agenda	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		153	5/18/2012	Atty Gen Local Government Debt Collection Pr	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		18	5/20/2011	State Budget Update	1
		191	9/24/2012	School Funding Present and Future	1
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		232	1/18/2013	Expedited Foreclosure	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		241	3/15/2013	What Can Financial Forecasting do for Local Go	1
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		259	5/17/2013	CAAO Mission, Policy., Collaboration with CA	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropriat	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		292	7/19/2013	Discussion of Biennial Budget	1
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		391	7/18/2014	Mt. Orab Police Department Canine Unit	1
		392	7/23/2014	GASB 68 Forum	1.5
		409	10/17/2014	* Cole's Warriors - No Second Chances	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		438	1/16/2015	BOR Reform Discussion	1
		50	9/16/2011	CAUV Qualification	1
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Pickaway Total	128
Pike	Ted L. Wheeler				
		105	2/10/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		106	2/10/2012	School Districts & Converting Inside Milage	0.75
		13	5/13/2011	Update on Ohio Weights & Measures Program	0.25
		135	4/13/2012	Valuation of Public Utility Pipelines & Railroads	1.25
		136	4/13/2012	Appraiser Standards Legislation	0.25
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		15	5/13/2011	Sticker Shock of CAUV Values Appraisal Ctys	1
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		231	1/11/2013	Legislative News and 2013 Priorities	1.5
		248	4/12/2013	Recent Developments in BOR Process	1
		249	4/12/2013	Solutions to Collecting Delinquent Prop Tax	0.5
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		289	7/12/2013	Discussion on New State Budget HB 59	1.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		364	4/11/2014	CAUV Discussion and Ohio Forest Ttax law	1.25
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Pike Total	70.75
Portage	Janet Esposito				
		172	7/6/2012	Fracking and Your Drinking Water	1.5
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		234	2/8/2013	Biennial State Budget - OBM Perspective	1.25
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		247	4/12/2013	Updates from BTA and Dept of Taxation	1.75
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		303	9/13/2013	Changes in Dog Licensing Laws	1
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		363	4/4/2014	Update from Tax Commissioner	1.5
		372	5/2/2014	What is the Open Data Initiative?	1
		377	5/28/2014	* Addiction Treatment & Issue of Relapse	1
		62	10/14/2011	Taxation of Oil and Gas Reserves	1.5
		69	10/28/2011	Certified public Records training	3
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		8	4/13/2011	* Ohio Ethics Law	1.5
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
				Portage Total	45.75
Preble	Mindy Robbins				
		1	3/16/2011	* Ohio Ethics Seminar	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		361	8/17/2012	Certified Public Records Training	3
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		438	1/16/2015	BOR Reform Discussion	1
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
<i>Preble Total</i>					69.25
Putnam	Robert Benroth				
		103	1/27/2012	Inspirational Leadership in Profound Times	1.5
		146	4/27/2012	Fundamentals of Weights & Measures & Leg Up	2
		155	5/25/2012	Legislative issues	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	0.75
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		175	7/26/2012	School Funding Present & Future	1
		192	9/27/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1
		207	10/8/2012	Education Day	6
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		245	3/22/2013	Recent Developments in Board of Revision Proc	1.25
		261	5/24/2013	State Budget Update	1
		293	7/26/2013	Ohio Housing Marker - Look at Details	1
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		399	8/22/2014	Professionalism Ohio Weights & Measures Offic	1
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		410	10/24/2014	Forestry Issues	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		439	1/23/2015	Auditor of State's Share Ohio	0.5
		447	2/27/2015	Items to Consider with a New Term of Office	1
		58	10/10/2011	Education day	6
		59	4/21/2011	NW Regional Advisory Board Mtg	1
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
		9	4/29/2011	Budget Updates State Rep. Goodwin	1.75
				Putnam Total	64.5
Richland	Patrick W. Dropsey				
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		441	3/8/2012	Working Hand in Hand w/ Cty Auditor	2.5
		442	8/2/2013	Auditor & Treasurer Fees and Election Costs	0.75
		443	1/9/2015	Cty Budget Commission, Inside Millage, Tax Set	1
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Richland Total	27.25
Ross	Thomas Spatnagel				
		250	4/12/2013	Affordable Care Act	2
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		330	8/21/2013	Accounting & Auditing Update	1
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		405	9/23/2014	* Overview of the Ohio Ethics Law	1
		418	4/14/2014	Certified Public Records	3
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
				Ross Total	28.25
Sandusky	William L. Farrell				
		1	3/16/2011	* Ohio Ethics Seminar	1
		131	3/23/2012	School District Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		132	3/23/2012	GIS in Erie County	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		155	5/25/2012	Legislative issues	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		174	7/20/2012	Local Government Forum: Municipalities, Twnh	2
		175	7/26/2012	School Funding Present & Future	1
		185	8/24/2012	The Appraisal and After the BOR is Filed	1.25
		19	5/20/2011	Board of Tax Appeals	1
		192	9/27/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1
		202	10/26/2012	Lucas County Land Bank	1.5
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		233	1/25/2013	Aspects of Appraisal Performance	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		245	3/22/2013	Recent Developments in Board of Revision Proc	1.25
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		299	8/23/2013	Fraud Prevention: A Proactive Approach	1
		3	3/25/2011	ODA Weights & Measures Training Program	0.75
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		308	9/27/2013	Social Media & Technology in Workplace	1.25
		309	10/4/2013	A.L.I.C.E. Training	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		312	10/11/2013	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		314	10/25/2013	Legal Updates & Sen. Randy Gardner	1.75
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		333	11/20/2013	Certified Public Records Training	3
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		362	3/28/2014	Classified and Unclassified Positions	1
		369	4/25/2014	How BTA is Affecting BOR & Cases	1.75
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		374	5/16/2014	Appraising Your Appraiser & Future of CAUV	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		393	7/25/2014	Qualities of Leadership	1
		395	7/31/2014	GASB 68 Forum	1.5
		399	8/22/2014	Professionalism Ohio Weights & Measures Offic	1
		401	9/12/2014	Preparing for Life's Curves	1.5
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		410	10/24/2014	Forestry Issues	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		439	1/23/2015	Auditor of State's Share Ohio	0.5
		56	9/23/2011	Wyandot County Regional Planning - Solar Arra	1.25
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
		9	4/29/2011	Budget Updates State Rep. Goodwin	1.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours	
					<i>Sandusky Total</i>	144
Scioto	David L. Green					
		137	4/20/2012	Certified Public Records	3	
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5	
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5	
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5	
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5	
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5	
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5	
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1	
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25	
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1	
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75	
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1	
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5	
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1	
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1	
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1	
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1	
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5	
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5	
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1	
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5	
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1	
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5	
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1	
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75	

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
				Scioto Total	83.5
Seneca	Julie A. Adkins				
		103	1/27/2012	Inspirational Leadership in Profound Times	1.5
		12	4/19/2011	Command, Coordination & Continuity	7
		131	3/23/2012	School District Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		132	3/23/2012	GIS in Erie County	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		146	4/27/2012	Fundamentals of Weights & Measures & Leg Up	2
		155	5/25/2012	Legislative issues	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		17	5/19/2011	Resource Solutions & Seneca Cty EMA	3.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		175	7/26/2012	School Funding Present & Future	1
		185	8/24/2012	The Appraisal and After the BOR is Filed	1.25
		19	5/20/2011	Board of Tax Appeals	1
		190	9/14/2012	Ohio GFOA Conference	14.3
		192	9/27/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1
		198	10/16/2012	Translating Health Care Reform	3
		202	10/26/2012	Lucas County Land Bank	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		233	1/25/2013	Aspects of Appraisal Performance	1
		239	2/22/2013	Rights to Appeal	4
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		245	3/22/2013	Recent Developments in Board of Revision Proc	1.25
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		293	7/26/2013	Ohio Housing Marker - Look at Details	1
		299	8/23/2013	Fraud Prevention: A Proactive Approach	1
		3	3/25/2011	ODA Weights & Measures Training Program	0.75
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		308	9/27/2013	Social Media & Technology in Workplace	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		314	10/25/2013	Legal Updates & Sen. Randy Gardner	1.75
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		362	3/28/2014	Classified and Unclassified Positions	1
		367	4/11/2014	CEBCO Annual Meeting	2.5
		369	4/25/2014	How BTA is Affecting BOR & Cases	1.75
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		404	9/24/2014	Prevent Employment Claims Before They Occur	2
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		410	10/24/2014	Forestry Issues	1
		42	7/14/2011	State Budget Seminar	3
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		439	1/23/2015	Auditor of State's Share Ohio	0.5
		447	2/27/2015	Items to Consider with a New Term of Office	1
		56	9/23/2011	Wyandot County Regional Planning - Solar Arra	1.25
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Seneca Total	198.75
Shelby	Dennis York				
		102	1/20/2012	Weights & Measures Issues	1
		129	3/16/2012	2012 Ohio Farm Bureau Agenda	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		153	5/18/2012	Atty Gen Local Government Debt Collection Pr	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		174	7/20/2012	Local Government Forum: Municipalities, Twnh	2
		18	5/20/2011	State Budget Update	1
		191	9/24/2012	School Funding Present and Future	1
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		232	1/18/2013	Expedited Foreclosure	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		245	3/22/2013	Recent Developments in Board of Revision Proc	1.25
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		259	5/17/2013	CAAO Mission, Policy., Collaboration with CA	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropriat	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		292	7/19/2013	Discussion of Biennial Budget	1
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		305	9/20/2013	Housing Trends & Choices in SW Ohio	1
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		353	1/17/2014	Butler County Web Portal	1
		373	5/16/2014	ADAMH Boards and Local Government in Ohio	1
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		409	10/17/2014	* Cole's Warriors - No Second Chances	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		43	7/22/2011	Montgomery County Reappraisal	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		438	1/16/2015	BOR Reform Discussion	1
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
				Shelby Total	128
Stark	Alan Harold				
		104	2/3/2012	What to Expect for 2012 with Legislature?	1.5
		11	5/6/2011	Report from Office of Auditor of State	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		113	3/2/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		114	3/2/2012	Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		147	5/4/2012	Impact of HB 14 - Dangerous Dogs	1
		148	5/4/2012	Ohio's Housing Markets, Why Data Matters	0.5
		150	4/26/2012	Certified Public Records Training	3
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		189	9/14/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities and Update	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		234	2/8/2013	Biennial State Budget - OBM Perspective	1.25
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		240	3/8/2013	Update on State Bienial Budget w/ Rep. Amstutz	1
		247	4/12/2013	Updates from BTA and Dept of Taxation	1.75
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropriat	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		288	7/12/2013	Perspectives on Ohio's New Budget	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		309	10/4/2013	A.L.I.C.E. Training	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		330	8/21/2013	Accounting & Auditing Update	1
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		355	1/31/2014	View from the Statehouse/ Leg Update	1
		356	3/7/2014	Programs Provided at MCCTC	1
		363	4/4/2014	Update from Tax Commissioner	1.5
		372	5/2/2014	What is the Open Data Initiative?	1
		401	9/12/2014	Preparing for Life's Curves	1.5
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		407	10/3/2014	131st General Assembly Priorities	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		440	1/30/2015	GIS in CAUV Field Verification	1
		45	8/5/2011	Paperless Reappraisal, Timing of Reapp, OSIP FI	1.5
		62	10/14/2011	Taxation of Oil and Gas Reserves	1.5
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours	
					<i>Stark Total</i>	100.75
Summit	Kristen M. Scalise					
		119	7/18/2011	Preventing Fraud and Embezzlement	20	
		120	8/9/2011	Commercial Paper, Bankers Acceptance	5	
		121	2/7/2012	Frequent Frauds found in Government	10	
		122	2/21/2012	Governmental and Nonprofit Update	18	
		151	11/16/2011	County treasurers' Fall Conference	3	
		152	12/31/2011	Investment Education	13	
		204	9/5/2012	* Practical Ethics for Fraud Examiners	2	
		216	12/7/2012	* Substance Abuse Awareness Training	1	
		240	3/8/2013	Update on State Bienial Budget w/ Rep. Amstutz	1	
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75	
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5	
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75	
		320	10/9/2013	Finding the Truth	20	
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5	
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1	
		355	1/31/2014	View from the Statehouse/ Leg Update	1	
		419	7/2/2014	* How to Build an Effective Ethics Program	3	
		420	10/24/2014	Conducting Internal Investigations	16	
		421	12/12/2013	Ohio Recorders 2013	9.5	
					<i>Summit Total</i>	127
Trumbull	Adrian Biviano					
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1	
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25	
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1	
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75	

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		321	5/10/2013	Shale Gas Valuation Issues	7
		322	10/16/2012	Predatory Lending #1	7
		323	10/17/2012	Predatory Lending #2	7
		324	5/21/2012	CFE Exam Prep Course	35
		325	12/31/2011	Accounting 1 Financial	90
		326	12/31/2012	Accounting 11 Managerial	90
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		356	3/7/2014	Programs Provided at MCCTC	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		62	10/14/2011	Taxation of Oil and Gas Reserves	1.5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
<i>Trumbull Total</i>					297.5
Tuscarawas	Larry Lindberg				
		147	5/4/2012	Impact of HB 14 - Dangerous Dogs	1
		148	5/4/2012	Ohio's Housing Markets, Why Data Matters	0.5
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		189	9/14/2012	CAAO Legislative Prioirites and Update	1
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		234	2/8/2013	Biennial State Budget - OBM Perspective	1.25
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		247	4/12/2013	Updates from BTA and Dept of Taxation	1.75
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		290	6/4/2013	Emerging Trends in Fraud Investigation	16
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		303	9/13/2013	Changes in Dog Licensing Laws	1
		309	10/4/2013	A.L.I.C.E. Training	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		363	4/4/2014	Update from Tax Commissioner	1.5
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		372	5/2/2014	What is the Open Data Initiative?	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		396	10/1/2013	Reporting Basics Part 1	2.5
		397	3/19/2014	Strateies to Address Cyber Intellegence and Fraud	1
		398	5/1/2014	Reporting Basics Part 2	2.5
		407	10/3/2014	131st General Assembly Priorities	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		45	8/5/2011	Paperless Reappraisal, Timing of Reapp, OSIP Fl	1.5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				<i>Tuscarawas Total</i>	144.75
Union	Andrea Weaver				
		1	3/16/2011	* Ohio Ethics Seminar	1
		102	1/20/2012	Weights & Measures Issues	1
		13	5/13/2011	Update on Ohio Weights & Measures Program	0.25
		135	4/13/2012	Valuation of Public Utility Pipelines & Railroads	1.25
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		15	5/13/2011	Sticker Shock of CAUV Values Appraisal Ctys	1
		153	5/18/2012	Atty Gen Local Government Debt Collection Pr	1
		154	5/16/2012	Status of US Real Estate Market Update	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		191	9/24/2012	School Funding Present and Future	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		2	3/18/2011	Report from Auditor of State's Office	0.5
		200	10/19/2012	CAAO Legislative Priorities	1.25
		208	11/5/2012	* USPAP Review	7
		213	2/1/2012	Ohio Public Records and Open Meetings Laws	3
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		232	1/18/2013	Expedited Foreclosure	1
		238	2/22/2013	Tax Policy and Rights to Appeal	7
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		241	3/15/2013	What Can Financial Forecasting do for Local Go	1
		245	3/22/2013	Recent Developments in Board of Revision Proc	1.25
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropriat	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		292	7/19/2013	Discussion of Biennial Budget	1
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		302	8/28/2013	2013 IAAO Conference	9
		304	9/13/2013	Ohio GFOA 2013 Conference	4.25
		305	9/20/2013	Housing Trends & Choices in SW Ohio	1
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		332	10/28/2013	Assessment Administration	30
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		353	1/17/2014	Butler County Web Portal	1
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		391	7/18/2014	Mt. Orab Police Department Canine Unit	1
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		409	10/17/2014	* Cole's Warriors - No Second Chances	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		438	1/16/2015	BOR Reform Discussion	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		50	9/16/2011	CAUV Qualification	1
		55	9/22/2011	2011 GFOA Annual Conference	6
		64	10/21/2011	Current BOR Issues, Appeals, S.Ct. Rulings	1
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
				<i>Union Total</i>	199.25
Van Wert	Nancy Dixon				
		103	1/27/2012	Inspirational Leadership in Profound Times	1.5
		107	9/1/2011	Political Day	2
		108	9/2/2011	Explanation of CAUV	1
		109	11/21/2011	Community Conversation on CAUV Rates	2
		110	9/15/2011	Agriculture Law	2
		112	2/23/2012	Certified public Records Training	3
		131	3/23/2012	School District Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		132	3/23/2012	GIS in Erie County	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		175	7/26/2012	School Funding Present & Future	1
		188	9/13/2012	Understanding the Casino Tax	1
		19	5/20/2011	Board of Tax Appeals	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		261	5/24/2013	State Budget Update	1
		293	7/26/2013	Ohio Housing Marker - Look at Details	1
		299	8/23/2013	Fraud Prevention: A Proactive Approach	1
		3	3/25/2011	ODA Weights & Measures Training Program	0.75
		308	9/27/2013	Social Media & Technology in Workplace	1.25
		314	10/25/2013	Legal Updates & Sen. Randy Gardner	1.75
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		350	12/11/2013	* Drug Free Safety in the Workplace	1
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		362	3/28/2014	Classified and Unclassified Positions	1
		369	4/25/2014	How BTA is Affecting BOR & Cases	1.75
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		447	2/27/2015	Items to Consider with a New Term of Office	1
		56	9/23/2011	Wyandot County Regional Planning - Solar Arra	1.25
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		9	4/29/2011	Budget Updates State Rep. Goodwin	1.75
				<i>Van Wert Total</i>	51
Vinton	Cindy Owings				
		105	2/10/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		106	2/10/2012	School Districts & Converting Inside Milage	0.75
		13	5/13/2011	Update on Ohio Weights & Measures Program	0.25
		135	4/13/2012	Valuation of Public Utility Pipelines & Railroads	1.25
		136	4/13/2012	Appraiser Standards Legislation	0.25
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		15	5/13/2011	Sticker Shock of CAUV Values Appraisal Ctys	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		194	10/12/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		231	1/11/2013	Legislative News and 2013 Priorities	1.5
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		311	10/11/2013	ODNR Forestry Property Tax Laws	1.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		408	10/10/2014	ODNR Presentaton - Hands on the Forest	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Differennt Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		437	1/9/2015	District Priorities for 2015	1
		47	8/19/2011	Key provisions of Budget Bill, Shale Oil & GasT	1.75
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Vinton Total	112.5
Warren	Nick Nelson				
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Warren Total	59.25
Washington	Bill McFarland				
		105	2/10/2012	Foreclosure Prevention in Your County	0.5
		106	2/10/2012	School Districts & Converting Inside Milage	0.75
		13	5/13/2011	Update on Ohio Weights & Measures Program	0.25
		135	4/13/2012	Valuation of Public Utility Pipelines & Railroads	1.25

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		136	4/13/2012	Appraiser Standards Legislation	0.25
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		14	5/13/2011	Ramifications of Senate Bill 5	1
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		15	5/13/2011	Sticker Shock of CAUV Values Appraisal Ctys	1
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		171	6/19/2012	Land Records Modernization Conference	5
		194	10/12/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1.5
		206	10/12/2012	Beginner Excel	4
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		248	4/12/2013	Recent Developments in BOR Process	1
		249	4/12/2013	Solutions to Collecting Delinquent Prop Tax	0.5
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		257	4/15/2013	Disciplining a Difficult Employee	2
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		297	8/6/2013	Harassment in the Public Sector	0.75
		298	8/16/2013	Sexual Harassment A Manager's Guide	1.25
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		313	9/16/2013	Mass Appraisal Class	30
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		352	1/10/2014	Update from Local Legislators	0.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		364	4/11/2014	CAUV Discussion and Ohio Forest Ttax law	1.25
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		375	5/20/2014	Mkt Analysis in Ad Valorem /Mass Appraisal	2

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		408	10/10/2014	ODNR Presentaton - Hands on the Forest	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		437	1/9/2015	District Priorities for 2015	1
		444	2/13/2015	BOR Rules and Procedures	2
		47	8/19/2011	Key provisions of Budget Bill, Shale Oil & GasT	1.75
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
				Washington Total	188
Wayne	Jarra L. Underwood				
		1	3/16/2011	* Ohio Ethics Seminar	1
		104	2/3/2012	What to Expect for 2012 with Legislature?	1.5
		113	3/2/2012	Foreclosure Preventionin Your County	0.5
		114	3/2/2012	Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		125	3/9/2012	2012 Property Conference	4
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		147	5/4/2012	Impact of HB 14 - Dangerous Dogs	1
		148	5/4/2012	Ohio's Housing Markets, Why Data Matters	0.5
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		172	7/6/2012	Fracking and Your Drinking Water	1.5
		189	9/14/2012	CAAO Legislative Prioirites and Update	1
		199	10/10/2012	BMV Fall Roundtable Training	3.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		234	2/8/2013	Biennial State Budget - OBM Perspective	1.25
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		240	3/8/2013	Update on State Bienial Budget w/ Rep. Amstutz	1
		247	4/12/2013	Updates from BTA and Dept of Taxation	1.75
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		294	8/13/2013	Paperless Reappraisal	3.5
		295	8/15/2013	Paperless Reappraisal	3.5
		296	7/11/2013	ESRI International User Conference	18
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		303	9/13/2013	Changes in Dog Licensing Laws	1
		309	10/4/2013	A.L.I.C.E. Training	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		310	10/4/2013	* Meth Labs Affect and Corrective Measures	1
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		355	1/31/2014	View from the Statehouse/ Leg Update	1
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		363	4/4/2014	Update from Tax Commissioner	1.5
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		389	6/23/2014	Customer Service the Foundations of Public Rela	7

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		390	7/11/2014	Future of BOR	1.5
		40	6/30/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
		401	9/12/2014	Preparing for Life's Curves	1.5
		41	6/30/2011	Record Retention Basics	1.5
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		440	1/30/2015	GIS in CAUV Field Verification	1
		45	8/5/2011	Paperless Reappraisal, Timing of Reapp, OSIP Fl	1.5
		62	10/14/2011	Taxation of Oil and Gas Reserves	1.5
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
Wayne Total					183.25
Williams	Deborah Nester				
		1	3/16/2011	* Ohio Ethics Seminar	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		146	4/27/2012	Fundamentals of Weights & Measures & Leg Up	2
		149	4/20/2012	Fundamentals of Mass Appraisal	30
		157	5/25/2012	Tax Policy	30
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		165	6/6/2012	Geographical Information Systems Initiatives	1
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		175	7/26/2012	School Funding Present & Future	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		19	5/20/2011	Board of Tax Appeals	1
		196	10/16/2012	National USPAP	15
		20	5/27/2011	Assessment Administration	30
		202	10/26/2012	Lucas County Land Bank	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		233	1/25/2013	Aspects of Appraisal Performance	1
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		261	5/24/2013	State Budget Update	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		293	7/26/2013	Ohio Housing Marker - Look at Details	1
		299	8/23/2013	Fraud Prevention: A Proactive Approach	1
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		302	8/28/2013	2013 IAAO Conference	11.5
		308	9/27/2013	Social Media & Technology in Workplace	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		314	10/25/2013	Legal Updates & Sen. Randy Gardner	1.75
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		362	3/28/2014	Classified and Unclassified Positions	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		395	7/31/2014	GASB 68 Forum	1.5
		399	8/22/2014	Professionalism Ohio Weights & Measures Offic	1
		410	10/24/2014	Forestry Issues	1
		414	3/7/2014	Customer Service-Foundation of Public Relation	7
		415	4/7/2014	* USPAP Update	7
		416	10/31/2014	Appraisal of Land	30
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		447	2/27/2015	Items to Consider with a New Term of Office	1
		65	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop AM Session	3
		66	10/26/2011	CAUV Workshop PM Session	1.75
		67	10/26/2011	CAUV Panel Discussion	0.5
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		70	11/4/2011	Income Approach to Valuation	30
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
		9	4/29/2011	Budget Updates State Rep. Goodwin	1.75
				Williams Total	334
Wood	Michael Sibbersen				
		103	1/27/2012	Inspirational Leadership in Profound Times	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		131	3/23/2012	School District Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		132	3/23/2012	GIS in Erie County	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		146	4/27/2012	Fundamentals of Weights & Measures & Leg Up	2
		155	5/25/2012	Legislative issues	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		171	6/19/2012	Land Records Modernization Conference	4
		175	7/26/2012	School Funding Present & Future	1
		185	8/24/2012	The Appraisal and After the BOR is Filed	1.25
		19	5/20/2011	Board of Tax Appeals	1
		192	9/27/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1
		202	10/26/2012	Lucas County Land Bank	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		245	3/22/2013	Recent Developments in Board of Revision Proc	1.25
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		251	4/26/2013	State Biennial Budget & Legislative Update	1.25
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropria	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		293	7/26/2013	Ohio Housing Marker - Look at Details	1
		299	8/23/2013	Fraud Prevention: A Proactive Approach	1
		3	3/25/2011	ODA Weights & Measures Training Program	0.75
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		308	9/27/2013	Social Media & Technology in Workplace	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		314	10/25/2013	Legal Updates & Sen. Randy Gardner	1.75
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		336	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop P.M. Session	2.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		345	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery Plans	1
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		362	3/28/2014	Classified and Unclassified Positions	1
		369	4/25/2014	How BTA is Affecting BOR & Cases	1.75
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		370	4/23/2014	Dealing with Problem Employees	3
		374	5/16/2014	Appraising Your Appraiser & Future of CAUV	1
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		393	7/25/2014	Qualities of Leadership	1
		395	7/31/2014	GASB 68 Forum	1.5
		399	8/22/2014	Professionalism Ohio Weights & Measures Offic	1
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		410	10/24/2014	Forestry Issues	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Differennt Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		431	11/20/2014	Preparation of CAFR & PAFR	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		439	1/23/2015	Auditor of State's Share Ohio	0.5
		447	2/27/2015	Items to Consider with a New Term of Office	1
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		76	11/29/2011	View from Inside Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
		9	4/29/2011	Budget Updates State Rep. Goodwin	1.75
				Wood Total	154.25
Wyandot	George W. "Bill" Kitzl				
		103	1/27/2012	Inspirational Leadership in Profound Times	1.5
		131	3/23/2012	School District Conversion of Inside Millage	0.5
		132	3/23/2012	GIS in Erie County	1
		138	3/27/2012	BTA Jurisdictional Issues	0.5
		139	3/27/2012	Prehearing Review, Negotiation, Settlement	0.5
		140	3/27/2012	BOR Hearings, Deliberation, Decisions	0.5
		141	3/27/2012	BOR Appeals	0.5
		142	3/27/2012	BTA Hearing	0.5
		143	3/27/2012	BTA Legal Review	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		144	3/27/2012	Mock BOR Hearings	1.5
		146	4/27/2012	Fundamentals of Weights & Measures & Leg Up	2
		155	5/25/2012	Legislative issues	2
		160	6/6/2012	Legislative Update	1
		161	6/6/2012	Trials & Tribulations of 1st Yr. in Office	1.5
		162	6/6/2012	Wetlands & Agriculture - CAUV Qualification	0.5
		163	6/6/2012	County Auditor Review of Exemption Applicatio	0.75
		164	6/6/2012	Update on Oil and Gas	0.75
		166	6/7/2012	Crisis Communications	1.5
		167	6/7/2012	Bond Refunding	1
		168	6/7/2012	Pension Legislation	1.25
		169	6/7/2012	Prosecutor & Sheriff Special Funds	1.5
		170	6/7/2012	TIFs, TIRCs, CRAs Tax Incentives	1.25
		173	7/10/2012	Certified Public Records Training	3
		185	8/24/2012	The Appraisal and After the BOR is Filed	1.25
		19	5/20/2011	Board of Tax Appeals	1
		192	9/27/2012	2013-2014 Legislative Priorities	1
		202	10/26/2012	Lucas County Land Bank	1.5
		217	11/27/2012	RightWeigh	1
		218	11/27/2012	Collaboration & Shared Services Cty Aud Role	1.25
		219	11/27/2012	OPERS Reform-How the New Law Impacts You	1
		22	6/6/2011	CAAO & Affiliate Organizations	0.75
		220	11/27/2012	Development Incentive Exemptions	1
		221	11/28/2012	* Ohio Ethics Laws	1
		222	11/28/2012	Special Assessments	1
		223	11/28/2012	Paperless Revaluations	1
		224	11/28/2012	Paperless Board of Revision	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		225	11/28/2012	Facts on Gas Well Drilling	1
		226	11/28/2012	Evaluation of Appraisals	1
		227	11/28/2012	Budget Commission & Schools	1
		228	11/29/2012	Preview of Biennial Budget & Leg Update	1.5
		23	6/6/2011	County Auditor's Role in Issuing Public Debt	1
		233	1/25/2013	Aspects of Appraisal Performance	1
		24	6/6/2011	OGRIP, Technology Opportunities, State Flyove	0.5
		245	3/22/2013	Recent Developments in Board of Revision Proc	1.25
		25	6/6/2011	Personnel Issues, Evaluations, Discipline, SB5	1.5
		251	4/26/2013	State Biennial Budget & Legislative Update	1.25
		252	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Morning Session	2.5
		253	5/8/2013	Legislative Day Afternoon Session	2.5
		26	6/7/2011	* Ohio Ethics Commission	1
		261	5/24/2013	State Budget Update	1
		262	6/10/2013	Taking Ownership of Your Data	1.5
		263	6/10/2013	Social Media & Tech Strategies Communicate w/	1
		264	6/10/2013	* Affordable Care Act & Impact on Counties	1.5
		265	6/10/2013	Biennial Budget Bill Update	1
		266	6/11/2013	Configuration of Appraisal Cycles	1.75
		267	6/11/2013	Your Home Your Value	1
		268	6/11/2013	How to Conduct an Auditor's Sale?	1.25
		269	6/11/2013	Real Estate Conveyances	1
		27	6/7/2011	Budget Commissionges	0.75
		270	6/11/2013	Real Estate Topics Panel Discussion	1
		271	6/12/2013	* Drug free Workplace Current Trends Appropriat	1
		272	6/12/2013	What it Means to be a Leader	1
		28	6/7/2011	Performance Auditing & Management, Shared S	1.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		29	6/7/2011	Fin Audits, Federal Schedule, Budgetary Laws	3.5
		293	7/26/2013	Ohio Housing Marker - Look at Details	1
		299	8/23/2013	Fraud Prevention: A Proactive Approach	1
		30	6/8/2011	Phase Out of TPP & SB 3 Reimbursements	0.75
		308	9/27/2013	Social Media & Technology in Workplace	1.25
		31	6/8/2011	Recent Trends in Real Property Values	0.5
		314	10/25/2013	Legal Updates & Sen. Randy Gardner	1.75
		315	10/7/2013	CAUV School Morning Sessions	3
		316	10/7/2013	CAUV School Afternoon Sessions	2.5
		32	6/8/2011	Establishing the Tax Rate	1.75
		33	6/8/2011	Explanation of Real Estate Assessment Fund	0.5
		335	11/22/2013	BOR Workshop A.M. Session	3
		337	11/20/2013	Legislative Update	1.5
		338	11/20/2013	HB 59 LGF Changes	0.5
		339	11/20/2013	Update from Tax Commissioner	0.5
		34	6/8/2011	Valuing Real Property	1
		340	11/20/2013	Explanation of ODT HB 59 Property Tax Law C	1.75
		341	11/20/2013	Update from the IRS	1.25
		342	11/21/2013	TIFs and TIRCs	1
		343	11/21/2013	Active Aggressor Shooter	1.5
		344	11/21/2013	Update from the Auditor of State	0.5
		346	11/21/2013	Disaster Recovery: When, Not If	0.5
		347	11/21/2013	Annexation Issues	1
		35	6/8/2011	BOR & BTA Appeals & Procedures	1
		354	1/24/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		36	6/9/2011	* Alcohol & Other Drugs: More than a Workplace	1
		362	3/28/2014	Classified and Unclassified Positions	1

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		369	4/25/2014	How BTA is Affecting BOR & Cases	1.75
		37	6/9/2011	Panel Discussion on Being County Auditor	1.5
		374	5/16/2014	Appraising Your Appraiser & Future of CAUV	1
		380	6/4/2014	Legislative Update	1.5
		381	6/4/2014	BTA Update	0.75
		382	6/4/2014	Homestead Exemption Panel Discussion	1.25
		383	6/5/2014	Social Media & Technology in the Workplace	1.5
		384	6/5/2014	Fundamentals of County Debt	1.5
		385	6/5/2014	Records Management for Cty Auds	1
		386	6/5/2014	Vendor License Web Portal & DTE Form 15A	1.75
		387	6/6/2014	Managing Messages Clearly Accountable	1.5
		393	7/25/2014	Qualities of Leadership	1
		399	8/22/2014	Professionalism Ohio Weights & Measures Offic	1
		406	9/26/2014	What Will the BOR be in Our Future?	1.5
		410	10/24/2014	Forestry Issues	1
		423	11/19/2014	BOR Reform - Where do we go from Here	1
		424	11/19/2014	Description of Different Types of Deeds	1
		425	11/19/2014	Update from ODT	0.5
		426	11/19/2014	Weights & Measures for County Auditors	0.75
		427	11/19/2014	Panel Discussion w/ Partner Associations	1
		428	11/20/2014	Changes to Single Audits OMB Super Circular	1
		429	11/20/2014	Special Audit Fairfield Cty Clerk of Cts	1
		430	11/20/2014	Mini GASB 68 Forum	1
		432	11/20/2014	OCCO Compensation Project	1.25
		433	11/21/2014	BWC Prospective Payment Program	1
		434	11/21/2014	Legislative Update & Priorities	1.75
		439	1/23/2015	Auditor of State's Share Ohio	0.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requirements

Ohio County Auditor Continuing Education Status Report

County Name	Auditor Name	Course #	Date	Course Title	Credit Hours
		56	9/23/2011	Wyandot County Regional Planning - Solar Arra	1.25
		68	10/28/2011	Taxaion of Wind Turbines	1
		7	4/6/2011	Legislative Day	5
		73	11/29/2011	Legislative Update	0.5
		74	11/29/2011	CAAO Overview	0.5
		75	11/29/2011	Review Operations of Board of Tax Appeals	0.75
		77	11/29/2011	Permissible Uses for REA/Appraisal Contracts	1.5
		78	11/29/2011	CAAO/UAN Financial & Payroll Project	1.5
		79	11/30/2011	Cost Allocation	1
		80	11/30/2011	IRS Update	1
		81	11/30/2011	Budget Commission and Tax Levies	1
		82	11/30/2011	Dealing with Staff in Diminishing Budgets	2
		83	11/30/2011	Things You Want to know about being a Cty Au	1.5
		84	12/1/2011	Certified Public Records Training	3
		9	4/29/2011	Budget Updates State Rep. Goodwin	1.75
Wyandot Total					162.5

* Denotes courses that qualify for the Ethics and Substance Abuse requiremnets